BID TABULATION - OPENED April 2, 2009

Bidder

Bidder

Bidder

Bidder

Bidder

Bidder

Bidder

siegel Single County Ditch Petition No. 687

Project #3 - 2009

Millcreek Township

Williams County Engineer
Dennis M. Bell, P.E.,
12953 County Road G

Bryan, OH 43506
419-636-2454

P.S.

Fax 419-636-8687 Mark Fichum Excavating Siegel Excavating Douglas Michael Paschal Bihn & Sons, Exc J D Construction Green's Excavating & Trucking Builders Pride, LLC
Date:3-5-09 _ Revised: South Charleston, Ohio West Unity, Ohio Edon, Ohio Oregon, Ohio Camden, Michigan Edon, Ohio Edon, Ohio
Ref. No. Item Description Unit Quantity Unit Price |Estimated Cost|Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost
DRAINAGE
1 202 __|Clearing and Grubbing LUMP 1.0 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000 00| $7,000.00| $3,487.50| $3,487.50| $6,800.00) $6,800.00|
2 603 _|<6" Type F Conduit for Farm Tile FT 100.0 $6.00 $600.00 M $300.00] $2.75) $275.00| $4.00) $400.00]
3 603 |>6" Type F Conduit for Farm Tile FT 100.0 $8.00 $800.00 $5.00 m $4.75] $475.00| $6.00) $600.00|
4 603 _|Tile Outlet Reconstruction EA 13.0 $200.00 $2,600.00 $175.00| $2,275.00] $150.00] $1,950.00) $170.00]
5 Special |Ditch Reconstruction Bottom* FT 2,400.0 $2.00 $4,800.00 $2.00 $4,800.00| $1.15] $2,760.00| $1.80)
6 Special |Ditch Reconstruction Bank** FT 4,808.0 $4.00 $19,232.00 $3.25| $15,626.00 $2.00) $9,616.00) $2.40)
* Bottom Dipping Sta 17+00 to Sta 41+00
|* Spoil Hauled Away Sta 17+00 to Sta 27+57.35
** One Sided Construction Sta 58+00 to Sta 72+07.83
EROSION CONTROL
7 207 _|Inlet Protection Filter Fabric Fence FT 50.0 $4.00 $200.00 $3.00 $150.00] $2.00) $100.00| $4.00) $200.00]
8 601 _|Dumped Rock Fill, Type C CY 10.0 $60.00 $600.00 $55.00 $550.00| $47.50 $475.00| $50.00 $500.00]
9 601 _|Dumped Rock Fill, Type C CY 50.0 $75.00 $3,750.00 $65.00 $3,250.00) $58.00 $2,900.00 $70.00 $3,500.00]
10 659 _|Dumped Rock Fill, Type C SY 24,000.0 $0.40 $9,600.00 $0.20 $4,800.00| $0.11] $2,640.00| $0.35] $8,400.00|
11 671 _|Dumped Rock Fill, Type C SY 12149 $4.30 $5,224.07 MC;' $5,224.07| $3.25] $3,948.43| $4.30) $5,224.07|
TOTAL $54,406.07 TOTAL BASE BID No Bid No Bid $44,475.07 No Bid $28,626.93 No Bid $43,693.27
[Bidder | Total Base Bid | Bidder Bidder Bidder Bidder Bidder Bidder Bidder
Automatic Septic & Well
Hancock Excavating J & M Excavating, Inc. Sand Ridge Excavating Corporation S. A. Sidle Construction, Inc.
Stryker, Ohio Cloverdale, Ohio Cloverdale, Ohio Holland, Ohio Holgate, Ohio
Unit Price Total Cost __|Unit Price Total Cost _[Unit Price Total Cost __|Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost __[Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost
Ref. No.
1 $5,999.00) $5,999.00/ $6,000.00| $6,000.00| $5,500.00) $5,500.00
2 $5.00) $500.00| $7.00 $700.00] $1.00] $100.00|
3 $7.00] $700.00| $7.00 $700.00] $1.25| $125.00|
4 $125.00] $1,625.00| $150.00| $1,950.00] $120.00] $1,560.00
5 $1.66| $3,984.00| $0.95 $2,280.00) $1.05] $2,520.00|
6 $2.81] $13,510.48| $2.80 $13,462.40) $2.45] $11,779.60|
7 $3.90) $195.00| $3.00 $150.00] $2.00) $100.00|
8 $89.00 $890.00| $55.00 $550.00] $60.00 $600.00|
9 $77.00] $3,850.00 $70.00 $3,500.00) $60.00 $3,000.00
10 $0.30) $7,200.00| $0.32 $7,680.00| $0.40) $9,600.00
11 $4.00) $4,859.60) $4.00 $4,859.60) $2.66] $3,231.63|
TOTAL BASE BID No Bid $43,313.08 $41,832.00 No Bid $38,116.23




	Bid Tab

